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Jesus Answers the
Disciples' Questions

(MATT. 24)
THE BACKGROUND
FOR THE TEACHING

There is much speculation concerning
the second coming of Christ today, which
i s d u e p a r t l y a s a r e s u l t o f
misunderstanding the teaching of Jesus in
Matt. 24; Mark 13:1-37 and Luke
21:5-36. If you are interested in a study
of this subject and wish to devote some
time to an understanding of it, then read
the Scriptures carefully first and become
familiar with them. In Matt. 24:3, the
disciples asked Christ three questions.
This was a result of one of the disciples
pointing out to Jesus the stones in the
temple buildings. The Jews were very
proud of these buildings, even though
they were not as splendid as the tempe
which Solomon built. Jesus tells this
disciple (Mark 13:1-2) that the time will
come when not one stone will be left
upon another. Later, Peter, Andrew,
James, and John (Mark 13:3) came to
Jesus privately and asked him, "Tell us,
when shall these things be? and what shall
be the sign when all these things shall be
fulfilled", Mark 13:4. In Luke 21:7, Luke
records the questions as, "But when shall
these be? and what sign will there be
when these things shall come to pass"?
Mark and Luke give only two questions.
When will the stones fall one from the
other, and what sign will there be to tell
them when the time was near? In Matthew
24:3, the questions are different, "Tell
us, when shall these things be? (the
destruction of the tempe, GVP) and what
shall be the sign of thy coming, and the
end of the world"? As the second coming
of Christ and the end of the world will be
the same time, there are really only two
questions here; when will Jerusalem and
the temple be destroyed and what will be
the sign of the end of the world?

THE APPROACH
TO UNDERSTANDING

In order to understand the teaching of
Jesus, we first must take in consideration
the questions to be answered. Tg know
when one question is answered and the
answer to the other begins. Due to the fact
that the second coming of Christ is not
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"Let No Man
Despise
Thy Youth"

A RESPONSIBILITY
The title of this article is taken from

the words of Paul, I Tim. 4:12, and was
written to a young man to instruct him in
his manner of conduct as he taught and
influenced his hearers. During the riots in
the colleges a few years ago, it was
determined that only about one percent
of all college students were involved in
these riots, yet all college students
suffered from the conduct of a few. This
is not right, but it is the world in which
we live. So the students who were not
involved had a grave responsibility to
prove to the world that the riots were not
a result of a certain age, or because they
were in college. On the other hand, were
unfortunate enough to have their "bad
apples" as well as all other age groups and
vocations. Their conduct was such that
they are no longer "depised" because
they are youth!

DRESS AND
LIFE STYLE

The many groups of young people
who have followed the anarchy trail have
dressed in such a way that even the dress
has become a symbol of the anarchist!
Their hair and their clothes sterotype
them as against 'the system". They have
no respect for the laws of God, the laws
of the land, or the rights of others! Even
before they have spoken, or done
anything, their "badge" tells the world
that they are anarachist! Like a police
officer who wears a badge to tell all,
along with his uniform., that he if FOR
law ad order. The hippy says by his
"badge" that he is against law and order!
Therefore he will prejudice the minds of
those who see him and they will greet
him with a closed mind.

PAUL AND TIMOTHY
The Jews would not listen to an

uncircumcised Gentile, regardless of how
fine a man he was. Peter would not even
go to the home of Cornelius, a devout
man, one who feared God, prayed and
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The Necessity of a
Child-Like Attitude

By Tommy Palmer
There is an age old adage that throbs

in ihe world like a continual heart-beat,
and can be felt throughout the history of
mankind. This is known as "world
standards". These are a set of man-made
rules, whereby man has the legality to
grab all he can, without regard for the
other fellow. It is more literally the old
adage of *'dog-eat-dog".

When Jesus Christ came into the world
He began to teach a New set of values.
This new set of values was designed to
change man, creating in him the desire
not to grab for self. This was complete
reversal of man's set of values and service.

In life it is all a question of where a
man's aims are centered. If his aims are
centered on the fulfillment of a personal
ambition, the acquisition of personal
power, the enjoyment of personal
prestige, or the exaltation of self, then he
is aiming at precisely the opposite of the
Kingdom of Heaven. To be a citizen of
the Kingdom means a complete forgetting
of self, the spending of self in a life which
aims at service and not at power. So long
as man considers himself as the most
important thing in the world, his back is
turned from the Kingdom. If he wants to
reach the Kingdom of Heaven, he must
turn around and face in that direction.

Many times we find an attitude of
selfishness, personal gain, and personal
profit. The disciples of Jesus heard His
discourse concerning the Kingdom of
Heaven and the new emphasis upon living
standards, yet they asked a question still
lingering with worldly value, "Who is the
greatest in the Kingdom of Heaven?"
(Matt. 18:1 RSV). Jesus answered,
"Unless you turn and become like
children, you will never enter the
kingdom of heaven." (Matt. 18:3).

Usually, a child has four great
qualities which make him the symbol of
those who are citizens of the Kingdom of
Heaven.

1. HUMILITY-A child does not wish
to push himself forward; rather, he is
content to be left in obscurity. A child is
one who is content in staying where he is,
rather than invading the world with an
attitude of self.
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